
 
 

 

December 8, 2005 
 
 
 
Mr. Kurt Spitzer 
Project Manager 
Pinellas County Charter Review Commission 
719 E. Park Avenue 
Tallahassee, FL  32302 
 
Enclosed are 25 copies of Appendices G, H, and I for inclusion in MGT’s Final Report–Fire 
and Fire Rescue Services Improvement Study–for Pinellas County Charter Review 
Commission.  The three appendices are titled:   
 

G. MGT’s Response to Report Comments from the Pinellas County 
EMS/Fire Administration Department (Appendix H) and the Fire Chiefs’ 
Association (Appendix I). 

 
H. Report Comments from Pinellas County’s EMS/Fire Administration 

   Department. 
 

 I.   Report Comments from the Pinellas County’s Fire Chiefs’ Association. 

An electronic copy is also available.  We ask that the copies be distributed to each member 
and appropriate record keepers of the Charter Review Commission. 

Thank you for your assistance. 

Sincerely, 

Stephen F. Humphrey, Jr. 
Senior Partner 
 
Enclosures 

 

 

J:\2689\Kurt Spitzer electronic letter 1208.doc 

 
 

Tallahassee Office 
2123 Centre Pointe Boulevard 

Tallahassee, Florida 32308 
P: (850) 386-3191 
F: (850) 385-4501 

www.mgtofamerica.com 





 
 Tallahassee Office 

2123 Centre Pointe Boulevard 
Tallahassee, Florida 32308 

P: (850) 386-3191 
F: (850) 385-4501 

www.mgtofamerica.com 

 
 
 
 

December 2, 2005 
 
 
 
Mr. Alan Bomstein, Chair 
Pinellas County Charter Review Commission 
620 Drew Street 
Clearwater, FL  33755 
 
Dear Mr. Bomstein:  
 
As requested, we have prepared a response to the November 7, 2005, documents from the 
Pinellas County Fire Chiefs’ Association and the EMS/Fire Administration Department of 
Pinellas County. 

Each of these documents discusses issues related to MGT’s final report on the Fire and Fire 
Rescue Services Improvement Study for the Pinellas County Charter Review Commission 
issued November 7, 2005. From our perspective, it is important to note that we issued two 
earlier versions of this report: (1) a preliminary draft report on September 19, 2005, and (2) a 
final draft report on October 11, 2005. The two earlier reports contained the majority of the 
information presented in the final version presented on November 7, 2005. Copies of the earlier 
versions were provided to both of the organizations noted above, as well as to representatives 
of the Pinellas County Council of Firefighters. These organizations provided no written 
comments on the two earlier study versions and provided their final set of comments only after 
the final report was given to the Commission. The primary purpose of the two initial versions 
was to solicit comments and then address the issues and data. We did ask both the Fire Chiefs’ 
Association and the County’s EMS/Fire Administration for their review of our earlier reports. 
However, none was provided prior to the November 7, 2005, meeting of the Charter Review 
Commission. 

While some of the issues set forth in the documents—and in the case of the Fire Chiefs’ 
Association, their presentation—are addressed in greater detail in this letter, we first wish to 
provide an overview with our impressions of the respective documents. 

Fire Chiefs’ Association 

When the Charter Review Commission began to discuss the possibility of taking another look at 
the fire and fire rescue function in Pinellas County (along with several other functions), the Fire 
Chiefs’ Association expressed concerns regarding the 1992 Fire Study and the possible new 
study. The Association then prepared a document outlining its ideas regarding study 
parameters. As the Charter Review Commission recognized, the Association’s document 
focused on fire departments’ effectiveness and addressed efficiency in only the most limited 
way. We do not believe this document served the Charter Review Commission’s objectives. 
Nevertheless, the Commission did see merit in some of the items and did include those items in 
a revised proposal from MGT. This revised proposal was accepted by the Commission and the 
items that were not included became the responsibility of the County to research and address 
as appropriate. 
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Representatives of the Fire Chiefs’ Association expressed concern about the revised study and 
their willingness to participate. MGT wanted them to participate and encouraged them to do so 
during the first several weeks of the study. However, the Association continued to express 
reservations and then chose not to participate, letting individual chiefs speak for themselves. 
After this decision, the Fire Chiefs’ Association, although not a participant, was provided with 
both electronic and manual versions of each of the three versions of the report.  

We do note that when several chiefs expressed concerns about a particular item in the report, 
for example automatic aid, the information was carefully researched and appropriate changes 
were made. We hoped the Association would participate in the study and we regret their failure 
to do so. It was apparent to us and others that the Association had decided to focus their efforts 
on discounting any study rather than seeking to provide advice and comment. 

In the November 7th meeting, the Fire Chiefs, in close association with the firefighters’ union, 
sought to challenge the final report through a letter to the Commission and a PowerPoint 
presentation. The Fire Chiefs’ presentation initially focused on elements of the proposed scope 
of work. Their knowledge of what was done was very limited as (1) they were not the client, (2) 
they provided no project input, and (3) they chose not to participate. However, the statement of 
work elements were done during the study and were covered in our Commendations, Findings, 
and Recommendations section of the report. Based on our research and discussions with the 
individual fire chiefs, we concurred that the current system was very effective and that each of 
the issues brought forth by the chiefs should be included in our evaluation. However, as the 
report grew more and more lengthy, we focused on elements relevant to the Commission’s 
responsibility to decide if any reason existed to take the current fire and rescue structure to the 
voters. 

It is our understanding that the primary purpose of this study was to provide advice regarding 
potential efficiency improvements to the fire system that would help the Commission to 
determine if Pinellas County voters should consider system modifications. As noted above, we 
found that the system was very effective and therefore did not meet the “should be voted on” 
criteria. However, we began to recognize that the cost of the system was an issue that met the 
criteria and warranted the Commission’s deliberation. Therefore, we focused our report on this 
issue. 

EMS/Fire Administration 

The Pinellas County EMS/Fire Administration, unlike the Fire Chiefs’ Association, was very 
helpful and sought to provide information in a comprehensive and timely manner. Throughout 
most of the study, and even when they disagreed with our comments, department 
representatives answered our questions and improved our appreciation of the fire and rescue 
services and the Sunstar services. 

Our only concern with the EMS/Fire Administration’s input was the County’s decision to withhold 
from MGT their comments on the first two drafts of our report. Many of the comments set forth in 
the EMS/Fire Administration’s letter would have clarified and enhanced our report. While most 
of our responses are provided in the section specifically addressing key issues in their letter, we 
wish to note a most important point. The County has proposed an alternative method to address 
the efficiency issue focusing more on equipment and reductions in fire and rescue staffing, 
rather than station closings or limited duty hours. Its cost savings estimate of $15,000,000 is 
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very similar to our estimate of $15,000,000 to $19,000,000. Interestingly, this estimate is also 
very similar to another consolidation regarding fire services. In Indianapolis, there has been 
significant effort to modify current legislation and consolidate the existing 10 fire operations as 
part of the overall implementation of a political consolidation approved by the city and voters 
several years ago. In this consolidation, the estimate of savings, should the 10departments 
become a single operation, is $19,000,000. Based on these estimates, we firmly believe our 
projected dollar savings is realistic. 

Our research has indicated that numerous jurisdictions, including the above, have recognized 
that the duplicate services found in a multi-department structure do represent a major and 
reducible cost. In the following, we address more specific key issues set forth in the Fire Chiefs’ 
Association and EMS/Fire Administration documents.  

Below are responses that directly relate to the comments provided by the Fire Chiefs’ 
Association and the County EMS/Fire Administration.  

Pinellas County Fire Chiefs’ Association  

The following section relates to the comments provided by the Pinellas County Fire Chiefs’ 
Association on the Fire and Fire Rescue Services Improvement Study prepared by MGT and 
submitted to the Pinellas County Charter Review Commission on November 7, 2005.  

Section 1 of the MGT Report generally provides background information regarding fire and EMS 
services in Pinellas County. The section contains no findings or recommendations. The Fire 
Chiefs’ Association Position Paper makes several comments on Section 1 that would have been 
good additions and clarifications to the final report had the Association provided them to MGT 
after the draft reports were initially distributed. However, as stated above, that was not the case, 
and comments were received after the final report was delivered. The Association’s comments 
regarding Section 1 are very specific, but not including their comments in Section 1 in no way 
detracts from the background information being presented. In fact, the Association’s last 
comment regarding Mutual Aid Analysis was changed in the final report after individual chiefs 
contacted MGT with questions on that subject. Because of the change, the Association’s 
comment regarding “the serious error in the document” regarding Mutual Aid—“THE ENTIRE 
SECTION SHOULD BE REMOVED FROM THE FINAL DOCUMENT BECAUSE IT IS FALSE 
AND MISLEADING”—is not valid.  

Section 2 of the MGT Report contains findings, commendations, and recommendations. On 
numerous occasions, the effectiveness of the Pinellas County fire and EMS services was 
recognized; indeed, it was never in dispute.  They are very effective fire and EMS services. 
However, it is strongly arguable that the fire and EMS services are not efficient. The MGT 
Report presents information received from the 911 Dispatch Center, interviews with fire 
department chiefs, and research on fire/EMS services in other locations around the country. The 
information below is not meant to respond to each and every criticism put forth by the 
Association, but rather addresses several criticisms that need to be contested.  
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Pages 2-9 to 2-14. The Association criticizes this section of the MGT Report, stating the section 
is inaccurate and misleading. Indeed, there were 522,000 emergency responses for calendar 
year 2004 for 152,882 incidents. The report identifies the responses by fire departments or 
ambulance (Sunstar) vehicles. Had the Association provided their comments prior to the final 
report, the reference to fire departments or ambulance vehicles would have been clarified to say 
“emergency vehicles” and Exhibit 2-3 would have stated Emergency Responses instead of Fire 
Department Responses. However, the Association states in its comments that 470,489 fire or 
ambulance vehicles were assigned to responses, of which, according to the Association, 45% 
were staff units or administrative pagers. However, these staff units often respond, which places 
another vehicle on the scene of the incident. [Note:  staff units and administrative pagers were 
not separately identified by the Association.]  The point being made in the MGT Report is that 
on average, more than three emergency vehicles respond to incidents, regardless of the type of 
vehicle responding or the type of incident. If one assumes 522,000 responses for 152,882 
incidents, the average number of emergency vehicles responding is 3.4; if 470,489 responses 
for 152,882 incidents is assumed, the average number of emergency vehicles responding is 3.1. 
[Although these figures relate to the entire calendar year 2004, MGT also conducted a similar 
analysis for a single month and, as stated in the MGT Report, came to similar conclusions.]  

Page 2-19 of the MGT Report discusses the number of stations with a small amount of activity. 
The report recognizes that all stations not only respond to incidents, but also have other duties 
and responsibilities including training, fire prevention and code enforcement, public fire and life 
safety education CPR training, etc. The report assumes that all stations conduct these other 
duties and responsibilities, so the focus is on fire and medical responses. The report makes an 
observation regarding activity and calls for an in-depth study to review those stations with low 
activity. The Association calls into question, “Who is going to complete the in-depth study….”  
The report answers that question by stating that a single fire district, as recommended, provides 
the governance structure to complete an in-depth study and that substantive efficiency changes 
can only be made from the countywide level. To conduct an in-depth study prior to establishing 
a single fire district would be biased with local jurisdiction politics and would arguably not lead to 
increases in efficiency.  

The Association questioned the potential cost savings associated with the closure and/or 
combining of fire stations and the reduction in the number of supervisory and/or administrative 
positions under different scenarios. In addition, the Association stated that the costs were not 
substantiated by anything. The report specifically states on pages 2-21 to 2-23 how the costs 
were developed. In addition, the Pinellas County EMS/Fire Administration calculated a similar 
figure when it analyzed the savings associated with the creation of a single fire district for the 
County.  

The Association called into question some of the research contained in the MGT Report. The 
point of the research is to show the inefficiency of a multiple ALS response (a response by ALS 
ambulances and ALS fire apparatuses). Combining reductions in the number of ALS vehicles 
responding to an incident with an appropriate level of response based on symptom guidelines 
will improve the efficiency of the service provided without any change to the effectiveness of the 
service provided. Research indicates that this is the case, and interviews with emergency 
services operators in other large jurisdictions indicate that efficiencies will be attained without
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decreases in effectiveness. As stated above, the mandate of the study was to provide advice 
regarding potential efficiency improvements for fire services in Pinellas County. A major 
potential efficiency improvement to the fire system would be to reduce the amount of duplication 
caused by multiple ALS responses.  

If the Association had provided their comments on the MGT Report prior to submission of the 
final report, many of them would have been included or responded to in the MGT Report. 
However, that was not possible due to the timing of the release of the Association’s comments.  

Pinellas County EMS/Fire Administration 

The Pinellas County EMS/Fire Administration staff presented their input on the MGT Report 
after the final report was presented to the Charter Commission. Had the County’s comments 
been provided to MGT before the final report was issued, many of them would have been 
addressed. The following comments are not meant to challenge the County’s assertions, but 
rather to respond to them.  

The County challenges the population figures contained on Page 1-6 of the MGT Report. The 
source of these figures was the 2000 U.S. Census. The unincorporated population identified is 
the population not associated with a city or town. MGT stands behind the U.S. Census 
population figures.  

Many of the comments from the County reflect wording changes. For example, the report made 
the following statement, “The contracts provide for a single-tier all Advanced Life Support (ALS) 
Emergency Medical System with a first responder component.”  The County submitted the 
following revised statement, “The contracts provide for a single-tier all Advanced Life Support 
(ALS) component within the all ALS Emergency Medical Services System.”  Clarifications such 
as this might have been helpful as the final report was prepared. However, as these 
recommended wording changes were not provided in advance of the final report, there was no 
opportunity to include any modifications or clarifications.  

The County took exception to remarks on the lack of countywide training. The information 
regarding the consistency of training between and among fire departments came from 
interviews with the various fire department chiefs. Yes, it is true that on occasion, different fire 
departments train together using a jointly developed curriculum. However, outside of the North 
County, this type of coordinated training activity is the exception and not the rule. The point 
being made in the report is that training is not consistent countywide. Some departments 
conduct in-depth training and train with other departments, while others rarely train with other 
departments and cover the curriculum material without hands-on application. On the other hand, 
training for paramedics is highly centralized through the County, and the County should be 
commended for establishing and maintaining a high-quality program. The County established, 
funds, and oversees the paramedic training, which indicates that centralized training can be 
accomplished with excellent success.  

The County questioned the analysis of the 20 fire stations with low busy rates. The intent of this 
section in the MGT Report is to point out that a significant number of stations have low 
utilization and therefore need to be looked at within the context of continued viability. 
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Without a single fire district, it would be difficult to plan the location of fire stations due to the 
jurisdictional issues that have historically arisen. As part of any in-depth review, appropriate 
“standards of cover,” response times, etc. would be determinants for station location, with the 
knowledge and understanding that station locations would not be hampered by jurisdictional 
conflict. The creation of a single fire district would allow for the types of in-depth studies 
necessary to improve the efficiency of the fire services provided to Pinellas County.  

The County questioned MGT’s recommendation that the Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 
should implement a priority dispatch system, stating that the Sunstar Paramedics have utilized 
Medical Priority Dispatch Protocols since 1980. The use of dispatch protocols by Sunstar is not 
in question. The issue is the use of dispatch protocols by the PSAP, which would use symptom 
guidelines on the initial 911 call to determine the response. The current policy is to dispatch a 
fire response (ALS) when the caller requests medical attention, regardless of the medical 
symptoms. The caller is then transferred to Sunstar for evaluation regarding an ambulance 
response. As stated in the MGT Report, many large jurisdictions have implemented priority 
dispatch using symptom guidelines to evaluate 911 calls, which in some cases has significantly 
reduced the number of responses by their fire departments. In order to improve the efficiency of 
fire department operations, the MGT Report strongly advises the Pinellas County PSAP to 
implement a priority dispatch system.  

The County is opposed to the MGT recommendation to create a single emergency dispatch 
center that co-locates all dispatchers for law enforcement, fire, and medical calls. The County 
states that one center could become a vulnerable single point of failure and therefore justify the 
use of Sunstar as a hot back-up site. While it is prudent to have a hot back-up site, it is not 
efficient to fully staff and operate multiple communications centers in the County. The County 
also argues that Sunstar must operate its own communications center as a “contractor,” with 
complete control over all aspects of their operation, including ambulance placement, movement, 
and the dispatch function. Those comments highlight a narrow issue relating to the Sunstar 
contract and not the efficient operation of the County’s fire and EMS system.  

The County strongly disagrees with the analysis that Sunstar does not need stoplight 
preemptive devices. The County argues (in a letter from the Sunstar Chief of Operations) that 
since the preemptive technology is currently installed (and used by fire departments), Sunstar 
ambulances should have these devices. No comment is made regarding compensation for the 
already installed system. The MGT Report cites research stating that only in the rarest of cases 
are lights and sirens transport required. Preemptive devices may reduce response times and 
patient transport times, but they will most certainly adversely impact the traffic flow on streets 
and roads, causing even more dangerous traffic problems. The argument provided by the 
County on this issue is not compelling enough to modify the recommendation to install 
preemptive devices in Sunstar ambulances.  

As with the information provided by the Pinellas County Fire Chiefs’ Association, had the County 
provided its feedback on the MGT Report prior to the release and presentation of the final 
report, MGT would have had the opportunity to respond to many, if not all, of the County’s 
comments and, where appropriate and justifiable, make changes based on the County’s input. 
Although the County’s information was not provided in a timely manner, MGT has attempted to 
respond to specific comments, many of which have been taken out of context. The focus of the 
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MGT study for the Charter Review Commission was to recommend opportunities to improve the 
efficiency of a very effective fire and EMS system for Pinellas County. The MGT Report 
provided the Charter Review Commission with the opportunity to improve the efficiency of the 
fire/EMS operation, with the strong possibility of reducing costs.  

Summary 

The primary purpose of the study was to provide to the Charter Review Commission with advice 
regarding potential efficiency improvements to the County’s Fire and Fire Rescue Services. 
Depending on the results of the study, the Charter Review Commission’s responsibility was to 
determine if Pinellas County voters should be asked to consider Fire and Fire Rescue system 
modifications.  While the comments provided by the Fire Chiefs’ Association and the County 
EMS/Fire Administration on the MGT Report were to some extent informative, the issue of the 
efficiency of the Fire and Fire Rescue Services in Pinellas County remains. The effectiveness of 
the Fire and Fire Rescue Services in Pinellas County has never been in question. However, as 
the MGT Report indicates, much inefficiency exists in the current Fire and Fire Rescue 
Services. Substantial savings could be achieved if a single fire district were created. Using an 
alternative method, the County EMS/Fire Administration came to almost the same potential 
dollar savings. Efficiencies to the services provided can be achieved, without impacting the 
effectiveness of very good Fire and Fire Rescue Services. MGT strongly believes that the 
analysis, findings, commendations, and recommendations contained in the report will be very 
useful in the continuing discussions regarding the future structure of the Fire and Fire Rescue 
Services in Pinellas County. 

If you need any further clarification regarding this letter, please call me at (850) 386-3191. 

Sincerely, 

 

 

 
 
 

Stephen F. Humphrey, Jr. 
Senior Partner 
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